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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY:

The purpose of this report is to update the Health and Wellbeing Board on the 
progress of the high-level Children’s and Young People’s Joint Strategic Needs 
Assessment (JSNA) 2016.

Services for children in the city are undergoing a period of change, including 
substantial reconfiguration and restructuring of a number of key services provided by 
both local government and the NHS. Although the JSNA does not make specific 
recommendations for service change, the JSNA provides evidence about key health 
outcomes for children. 

Understanding the impact of changes on health outcomes and identifying how the 
measures outlined in the JSNA can be implemented during this period of change will 
be an important challenge for local public services and for the Health and Well-being 
Board locally. 

The CYP JSNA 2016 has been designed to be predominantly web-based and 
iterative in nature, with annual reviews of sections planned. It has been produced by 
a multi-agency team overseen by the JSNA Programme Board. 

A summary document, Snapshots: Children and Young People, has been prepared 
to both accompany the more detailed briefings and promote use of the JSNA web 



pages. Snapshots is attached as Appendix A. The infographics in the Snapshots 
document will be made available on the JSNA web pages for downloading and for 
use in presentations of various types.

The CYP JSNA will be live on the Leicester City Council website shortly. The 
chapters covered are listed in Appendix B. The web-pages provide a brief summary 
of each chapter (as a web page), links to a further (PDF) briefing on the topic and to 
links within and also external to the council to relevant plans, profiles and data 
sources. There are introductory pages which explain the purpose and use of the 
web-pages. 

The CYP JSNA involved two sets of engagement with stakeholders. The 
engagement was delivered by VAL.

A children’s survey is currently underway which will provide data on young people’s 
views of their health and well-being. This is due to report in late Spring.

The recommendations of the JSNA will be discussed at the Children’s Trust Board on 
27 January 2017 and these will be presented to the Board at the meeting.  

RECOMMENDATIONS:

The Health and Wellbeing Board is requested to discuss and agree the 
recommendations of the JSNA that will be presented at the meeting. 

Appendix A: Snapshots infographics



Appendix B: Chapters Included in the CYP JSNA 2016

 Introduction to JSNA

 Demography of Leicester’s Children and Young People

 PreBirth and Early Life

 Early Years (0 to 4)

 School Years (5 to 19)

 Young Adults (20 to 24)

 Mental Health of Children and Young People

 Looked After Children

 Youth Offenders

 Vulnerable Groups (Includes Female Genital Mutilation, Child Sexual 

Exploitation and Gypsies and Travellers)


